
Sunjoy® Mini Salsa Barberry
Berberis thunbergii ‘Mimi’ PPAF

SPECS

Height: 18-24"

Spread: 18-24"
Shape: mounded
Foliage: red
Fall Color: red
Flowers: yellow
Fruit: bright red
Zone: 4

DESCRIPTION

The season-long color that
Barberry brings to the landscape
makes them popular garden
shrubs. A multitude of foliage
colors exist, which provide
interest from Spring to Fall, and
their spiny branches are
invaluable for use as hedging
and barrier plants. They
transplant easily, withstand
pruning, and are adaptable to
various growing conditions.
Sunjoy® Mini Salsa is an
improved variety of ‘Crimson
Pygmy’, offering a consistent
compact form without pruning,
and dark red foliage.
The compact size of Sunjoy®
Mini Salsa is perfect for edging
the fronts of borders, as a mass
planting and in rock gardens. 
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